SOLICITATION NO.: DACWO03-02-B-0035

DATE & TIME: 07 October 2002

OPENED BY: Deannda K night

BID TABULATION

PROJECT: Cleanup Services at Parks/Areas of Dardanelle Field Office
Schedule A, B.C,D

ASSIGNED TO: Deannda K night

FUNDSAVALIABLE (Applicable W/Additives)

AMENDMENTS: 2 SBSA: UNRESTRICTED:
SCHEDULE: _A
Bidder | Bidders Name/Address Sze | Ame Base Period First Option Second Third Fourth Total
Option Option Option

OJ S Services Company

1020 W. 3¢ B 26,389.50 25,951.65 26,516.90 26,461.25 26,186.85 131,506.30
1 Little Rock, AR 72201

Western Maintenance LRC

P.O. Box 963 B X 55,122.70 54,080.35 55,477.15 55,355.10 54,825.10 274,860.40
2 Bensall, CA 92003

T.N.T Cleaning Services

P.O. Box 2162 B No Bid
3 Forth Smith, AR 72902

Pikes Peak Satcom, Inc.

3855 E. Pikis Peak Ave B 72,178.57 72,178.57 72,178.57 72,178.57 72,178.57 360,892.90
4 Colorado Springs, CO

William J. Case

225 Sunset Lane B 33,905.00 33,325.00 34,063.00 33,985.00 33,735.00 169,013.00
5 Knoxville, AR 72845

B & B Cleaning WO

122 Shadybrook No Bid
6 Morrilton, AR 72110 SB
7
8




SOLICITATION NO.: DACWO03-02-B-0035

DATE & TIME: 07 October 2002

BID TABULATION
PROJECT: Cleanup Services at Parks/Areas of Dardanelle Field Office
Schedule A, B.C,D

OPENED BY: Deannda K night

ASSIGNED TO: Deannda K night

FUNDSAVALIABLE (Applicable W/Additives)
AMENDMENTS; _ 2 SBSA: _X__ UNRESTRICTED:

SCHEDULE: B
Bidder | Bidders Name/Address Sze | Ame Base Period First Option Second Third Fourth Total
Option Option Option

OJ S Services Company

1020 W. 3¢ B 18,386.20 18,539.30 18,584.30 18,539.30 18,330.60 92,079.70
1 Little Rock, AR 72201

Western Maintenance LRC

P.O. Box 963 B X 33,270.00 33,456.00 33,531.00 33,456.00 33,093.00 166,813.00
2 Bensall, CA 92003

T.N.T Cleaning Services

P.O. Box 2162 B 90,790.79 92,654.40 93,582.42 94,074.72 93,748.39 464,850.72
3 Forth Smith, AR 72902

Pikes Peak Satcom, Inc.

3855 E. Pikis Peak Ave B 76,217.31 76,217.31 76,217.31 76,217.31 76,217.31 381,086.60
4 Colorado Springs, CO

William J. Case

225 Sunset Lane B 24,585.00 24,790.00 24,850.00 24,790.00 24,520.00 123,535.00
5 Knoxville, AR 72845

B & B Cleaning WO

122 Shadybrook No Bid
6 Morrilton, AR 72110 SB
7
8




SOLICITATION NO.: DACWO03-02-B-0035

DATE & TIME: 07 October 2002

BID TABULATION
PROJECT: Cleanup Services at Parks/Areas of Dardanelle Field Office
Schedule A, B.C,D

OPENED BY: Deannda K night

ASSIGNED TO: Deannda K night

FUNDSAVALIABLE (Applicable W/Additives)

AMENDMENTS: 2 SBSA: X UNRESTRICTED:
SCHEDULE: C
Bidder | Bidders Name/Address Sze | Ame Base Period First Option Second Third Fourth Total
Option Option Option

DJ S Services Company

1020 W. 3¢ B 16,278.80 16,120.90 16,434.20 16,226.30 16,329.20 81,389.40
1 Little Rock, AR 72201

Western Maintenance LRC

P.O. Box 963 B X 23,180.00 22,944.00 23,404.00 23,103.00 23,253.00 115,884.00
2 Bensall, CA 92003

T.N.T Cleaning Services

P.O. Box 2162 B No Bid
3 Forth Smith, AR 72902

Pikes Peak Satcom, Inc.

3855 E. Pikis Peak Ave B 39,364.31 39,364.31 39,364.31 39,364.31 39,364.31 196,821.55
4 Colorado Springs, CO

William J. Case

225 Sunset Lane B 16,110.00 15,955.00 16,270.00 16,050.00 16,155.00 80,540.00
5 Knoxville, AR 72845

B & B Cleaning WO

122 Shadybrook 14,460.00 14,310.00 14,590.00 14,400.00 14,490.00 72,250.00
6 Morrilton, AR 72110 SB
7
8




SOLICITATION NO.: DACWO03-02-B-0035

DATE & TIME: 07 October 2002

BID TABULATION

PROJECT: Cleanup Services at Parks/Areas of Dardanelle Field Office

Schedule A, B.C. D

OPENED BY: Deannda K night

ASSIGNED TO: Deannda K night

FUNDSAVALIABLE (Applicable W/Additives)

AMENDMENTS: 2 SBSA: X UNRESTRICTED:
SCHEDULE: D
Bidder | Bidders Name/Address Sze | Ame Base Period First Option Second Third Fourth Total
Option Option Option

OJ S Services Company

1020 W. 3¢ B 35,885.15 35,825.15 35,596.65 36,162.25 36,064.65 179,533.85
1 Little Rock, AR 72201

Western Maintenance LRC

P.O. Box 963 B X 36,495.00 36,406.00 36,132.00 36,750.00 36,656.00 182.439.00
2 Bensall, CA 92003

T.N.T Cleaning Services

P.O. Box 2162 B
3 Forth Smith, AR 72902

Pikes Peak Satcom, Inc.

3855 E. Pikis Peak Ave B 96,450.72 96,450.72 96,450.72 96,450.72 96,450.72 482,253.60
4 Colorado Springs, CO

William J. Case

225 Sunset Lane B 31,319.00 31,257.00 31,032.00 31,543.00 31,469.00 156,620.00
5 Knoxville, AR 72845

B & B Cleaning WO

122 Shadybrook 31,322.00 31,154.00 30,966.00 31,434.00 31,354.00 156,130.00
6 Morrilton, AR 72110 SB
7
8




